CITY OF CONCORD
CERTIFIED BID TABULATION FORM

STREETS PRESERVATION CONTRACT STR24 Bid No. 2584

LOCATION: TRAFFIC MANAGEMENT CENTER, 880 WARREN C COLEMAN BLVD CONCORD, NC

TIME: 2:00 P.M. DATE:  June 7th, 2023
Blythe Brothers Asphalt
Contractor Blythe Construction Inc. Ferebee Corporation J.T. Russell & Sons, Inc. | Reeves Construction Company Co. LLC
N.C. License No. 7639 18306 2767 987 42840
Address PO Box 31635 PO Box 480066 PO Box 670 18606 Northline Drive 1415 E Westinghouse Blvd
City, State Zip Charlotte, NC 28231 Charlotte, NC 28269 Albermarle, NC 28002 Cornelius, NC 28031 Charlotte, NC 28273
5% Bid Bond Included Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
No. | Item Units|Quantity] Unit Price|] Item Total |Unit Price Item Total Unit Price| Item Total Unit Price Item Total |Unit Price| Item Total
Crack and Joint Sealing
1.1 |Seal Existing pavement cracks and joints Ibs 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Patching, Leveling, Asphalt Seal Coating
Asphalt Full Depth Finished Patching - Place and compact
Intermediate Course 3" 119.0B with 2" Surface Course 89.5 B Cap $170.00 | $340,000.00 | $138.75 $277,500.00 $175.00 | $350,000.00 $250.00 $200.00
2.1 |(areas to be determined) Tons| 2,000 $500,000.00 $400,000.00
Asphalt Full Depth Patching - Place and compact Intermediate
2.2 |Course 119.0B (no Surface Course Cap) Tons 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID h NO BID
2.3  |Asphalt Leveling - Place and compact Intermediate Course 119.0B | Tons | 10,960 | $100.00 | $1,096,000.00 | $108.36 | $1,187,625.60 | $120.00 | $1,315,200.00 $119.00 $1,304,240.00 | $115.00 | $1,260,400.00
Asphalt Leveling - Place and compact Asphalt Open Graded Leveling
2.4 |Course (P78 or mix as approved by Director) Tons 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
Place and compact suitable Sub-base material (Location to be
25 |determined) Cu.vd 100 | $120.00 | $12:000.00 | ¢75 09 §7.500.00 1 $200.00 | $20.000.00 $121.00 $12,100.00 | $125.00 | $12,500.00
2.6 |Asphalt Seal Coat 5q. Yd 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
$1,448,000.00 $1,472,625.60 $1,685,200.00 $1,816,340.00 $1,672,900.00
Milling
3.1 |Full Mill the bituminous pavement - Depth 0” to 4” 8q. Yd 21,195 $3.30 $69,943.50 $3.33 $70,579.35 $5.00 $105,975.00 $4.00 $84,780.00 $3.40 $72,063.00
3.2 |Edge Mill the bituminous pavement - Depth 0” to 4” 8q. Yd 21,985 $3.03 $66,614.55 $3.56 $78,266.60 $5.00 $109,925.00 $4.00 $87,940.00 $3.50 $76,947.50
3.3 |Incidental Milling 0” to 6” Sq. Yd 100 $30.00 $3,000.00 $4.00 $400.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $50.00 $5,000.00 $19.00 $1,900.00
$139,558.05 $149,245.95 $217,900.00 $177,720.00 $150,910.50
Reclamation
4.1 Reclamation of existing roadway with concrete stabilization 8q. Yd| 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
Undercut and replace with approved suitable material for subgrade
4.2  |repairs Tons 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Resurfacing
Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.25” of Surface Course
5.1 |S9.5B Tons| 8,480 | $110.00 | $932,800.00 | $118.31 $1,003,268.80 $130.00 | $1,102,400.00 $130.00 $1,102,400.00 | $125.00 | $1,060,000.00
Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.5” of Surface Course
52 |[S95B Tons| 1,980 | $109.00 | $215,820.00 | $113.60 $224,928.00 $130.00 | $257,400.00 $130.00 $257,400.00 | $125.00 | $247,500.00
$1,148,620.00 $1,228,196.80 $1,359,800.00 $1,359,800.00 $1,307,500.00
Concrete
City of Concord Standard Valley Type Concrete Curb and Gutter
6.1  |(Incidental and as directed: LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
City of Concord Standard 2’-6” Concrete Curb and Gutter (Incidental
6.2 |and as directed): LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
6.3 |Wheelchair Ramps (Incidental and as directed: Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
6.4 |4” Thick Concrete Sidewalk 8q. Yd| 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Re-Striping, Remarking. And Replace Pavement Marker
7.1  |Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4” Double Yellow Solid LF | 17,370 | $2.55 $44.293.50 $3.03 $52,631.10 $3.00 $52,110.00 $2.55 $44,293.50 $2.55 $44,293.50
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4” Yellow Solid, Skip, and
7.2  |Mini Skip Line LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
7.3  |Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 8" Yellow Gore Line LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4" White Solid, Skip, and
7.4  [Mini Skip and Parking Stall Line LF 1,290 $2.30 $2,967.00 $4.40 $5,676.00 $3.00 $3,870.00 $2.30 $2,967.00 $2.30 $2,967.00
7.5 |Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines STOP Bar - 24” LF 145 $16.50 $2,392.50 $27.50 $3,987.50 $20.00 $2,900.00 $16.50 $2,392.50 $16.50 $2,392.50
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines Crosswalk - 8" White
7.6 |NCDOT Std. LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines Crosswalk, Hi-Visibility -
7.7  |24" White Bars NCDOT Std. LF 145 $16.50 $2,392.50 $27.50 $3,987.50 $20.00 $2,900.00 $16.50 $2,392.50 $16.50 $2,392.50
7.8 |Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Yield Lane Symbol LF 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Thur, Right-Turn or Left-
7.9 |Turn Arrow Ea. 22 $155.00 $3,410.00 $275.00 $6,050.00 $180.00 $3,960.00 $155.00 $3,410.00 $155.00 $3,410.00
Thermoplastic Pavment Marking Symbol Combo Arrow - Thur-Rt. /
7.10 |Thru-Lf./ Thru Rt. & Lf. Ea. 5 $185.00 $925.00 $550.00 $2,750.00 $210.00 $1,050.00 $185.00 $925.00 $185.00 $925.00
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Characters 8'-4" NCDOT
711 |Std. Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol SCHOOL 10" w/ 24" Band
7.12 |NCDOT Std. Ea. 1 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00
7.13 |Thermoplastic Marking Symbol Railroad - RXR NCDOT Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Shared Lane
7.14 |NCDOT Std. Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Bicycle Detector NCDOT
7.15 |Std. Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Symbol Handicap Symbol
7.16 |NCDOT Std. Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
7.17 |Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Yellow / Yellow Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
7.18 |Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Red Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Blue / Blue at Fire Hydrant
7.19 |Locations Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
7.20 |Permanent Raised Pavement Marker Crystal / Crystal Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
7.21 |(Match Exisiting) - "Fire Lane" Red Box with White Lettering Ea. 0 - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID - NO BID
$57,630.50 $77,282.10 $68,290.00 $57,630.50 $57,630.50
Alt. Resurfacing Bid
Asphalt Full Depth Finished Patching - Place and compact
Intermediate Course 3" 119.0B with 2" Surface Course S9.5 B Cap
A8.1 |(areas to be determined) TN 40 $250.00 | $10,000.00 | $138.75 $5,550.00 $175.00 $7,000.00 $530.00 $21,200.00 | $225.00 $9,000.00
A8.2 |Edge Mill the bituminous pavement - Depth 0” to 47 Sq. Yd 170 $30.00 $5,100.00 $3.56 $605.20 $6.50 $1,105.00 $45.00 $7,650.00 $25.00 $4,250.00
Asphalt Resurfacing - Place and compact 1.25” of Surface Course
A8.3 [S9.5B TN 210 $220.00 $46,200.00 $118.31 $24,845.10 $130.00 $27,300.00 $175.00 $36,750.00 $135.00 $28,350.00
Thermoplastic Pavement Marking Lines 4" White Solid, Skip, and
A8.4 |Mini Skip and Parking Stall Line LF 625 $5.50 $3,437.50 $8.80 $5,500.00 $7.00 $4,375.00 $5.50 $3,437.50 $5.50 $3,437.50
$64,737.50 $36,500.30 $39,780.00 $69,037.50 $45,037.50

BASE BID SECTIONS SUBTOTAL
+10% CONTINGENCY

$2,793,808.55
$279,380.86

$2,927,350.45

$292,735.05

$3,331,190.00
$333,119.00

$3,411,490.50
$341,149.05

$3,188,941.00
$318,894.10

TOTAL BASE BID

$3,073,189.41

$3,220,085.50]

$3,664,309.00

$3,752,639.55

$3,507,835.10

ALTERNATE BID

$64,737.50

$36,500.30]

$39,780.00

$69,037.50

$45,037.50

TOTAL BID

$3,137,926.91

$3,256,585.80]

$3,704,089.00

$3,821,677.05

$3,552,872.60

Thisisto certify that bids tabulated herein were publicly opened and read aloud at 2:00 p.m. on April 18, 2022, in the conference
room at the Brown Operations Center at 635 Alfred Brown Jr. Ct. SW, Concord, North Carolina.

This Certified Bid Tabulation is true and correct to the best of my abilities and knowledge.

(amounts rounded up to nearest $0.01)

signed: Phellit Grabiam, PE

Phillip Graham, P.E., Transporatation Director
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